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Vasantham 2022 – A Big Thank You 

The “Vasantham 2022” musical programme organised by Kokuvil 

Hindu College Old Students’ Association UK, took place on 18 Sep 
2022; it had a special significance this year because the 

organisation was celebrating its 30th Anniversary of their presence 

in the UK. 

The programme was made up primarily of musical performance by 

popular Sri Lankan artistes (Ananthan – USA ( KHC old student), 
Magisha – Canada (daughter of KHC old student who contested in 

junior super singer), super singers Punniya from UK and Nirujan 
from Germany, Aravinthan – Canada (Keyboard Player) and 

Pargavi Thillairajan (daughter of KHC old student). Singer Bathra 
and the 3 young back-up singers (Harini, Swithi & Laxmi) provided 

tasteful musical backing for the main singers. The singers were 
expertly supported from start to finish by our local music group 

Rainbow Music Band, led by Sripathy. 

This year, we adopted a new format where we arranged for a get-

together session, before the start of the musical performance, 
which allowed the participants to mingle amongst friends and 

socialise in an informal atmosphere.  The attendance of past 

students from 1985, 1986, 1987, 1990 and 1991 Advanced Level 
batches who did travel from afar made this get-together session 

more meaningful and enjoyable. 

A great number of people deserve recognition for their contribution 

to an amazing Vasantham 2022 show, viz: 

Our Chief Guest Mr V Tharmarajah, and his wife Indra Devi, for 

their acceptance of our invitation, honouring us with their presence 
and celebrating this year’s Vasantham show with us. 

Mrs Sai Janani (Canada), KHC old student and Canada OSA 
Committee member, for her enchanting way of entertaining and 

captivating the audience in presenting Vasantham 2022 and 
making it a lively event. 

All the artistes from home and abroad, organisers and facilitators 
for enabling us to present a remarkable show for the 

entertainment and enjoyment of the assembled spectators. 

We are thankful to the Media Sponsor Focuscia for a magnificent 

stage arrangements and LED stage displays. Special mention must 

also go to our Photography Sponsor JayLux for a tremendous  
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photographic contribution on the day. We also thank Nakshatra 
Hall Venue Administration for helping us to deliver a successful 

Vasantham 2022 event. 

A big bow to all the past students from the various A/L batches 

who made a special effort to travel from overseas and far-away 

places to make our Vasantham 2022 event a memorable one. 

Also, a big thank you to all of our traditional supporters, who 

support us year on year, for their generous support for the 
Vasantham 2022 programme and for the OSA UK in particular. 

Our deepest gratitude to all the commercial sponsors, large and 
small, for their sponsorship and continued patronage. We 

acknowledge the contributions by our Main Sponsors KKR 
Structural Engineers & Architects, MIA Mortgage Insurance 

Advisers, Satk Inn Group, Mullai Express Restaurant, Brit Bricks 
Property Services and Co-sponsors RiverSure, Fenix Property 

Services, Krishnika Jewellers and Casuarina Tree Restaurant. We 
are very much honoured and proud to broadcast that our sponsors 

KKR, Satk Inn, Fenix and Mullai Express are all old students of 
Kokuvil Hindu College. 

Lastly, all the members of the Executive Committee, co-opted 

members and office bearers who worked tirelessly to bring 
Vasantham 2022 to a high standard and an outstanding event.  

We hope you all enjoyed the experience and we’d be incredibly 
grateful for any feedback you might have for us. Looking forward 

to meeting you again next time. 

For all those who missed the show, for whatever reason, it is 

available in YouTube under the title “Vasantham 2022”. Enjoy the 
recording.  
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